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Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
johnsonre@jccal.org

HELENA CHEMICAL

HUMPHRIES TURF SUPPLY

RED RIVER SPECIALITIES, LLC.

VM DISTRIBUTION PARTNERS

s Unitof | Mfg./Product | Price Each | Estimated | Extended Price | Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Each| Estimated Extended Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Each | Estimated | Extended Price Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Estimated | Extended Price
Item No. Description . . . . .
Measure No. Quantity Measure No. Quantity Price Measure No. Quantity Measure No. Each Quantity
Grand Total
1 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2.5 GAL MONSANTO $ 1789 | 915GAL |$ 16,369.35 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 62.49| 915GAL ($ 22,871.34 GAL MONSANTO | $ 15.43| 915 GAL $ 14,118.45 GAL MONSANTO | $ 18.50 915GAL |$ 16,927.50
GAL CONTAINER 524-529
2 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 30 GAL MONSANTO $ 17.72| 660GAL |$ 11,695.20 30 GAL BLANK $ 429.79| 660GAL | $ 9,455.38 GAL MONSANTO | $ 1498| 660GAL [$ 9,886.80 GAL MONSANTO | $ 17.95 660 GAL |$ 11,847.00
GAL CONTAINER 524-529
MONSANTO
3 ROUNDUP PRO DRY LB 524-505 $ 7.83 235 LB. $ 1,840.05 | 6.8 LBUG BLANK $ 79.95| 235LB. $ 2,763.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID 235LB. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 235LB. NO BID
4 MILESTONE 2.5 GAL GAL 627D;1C;\.Ig19 $ 31250 | 250GAL |$ 78,125.00 QUART BLANK $ 106.79| 250GAL | $ 106,790.00 GAL DOW $ 31250 250GAL [$ 78,125.00 GAL DOW $ 31250 250GAL |$ 78,125.00
5 OUST XP LB BBASZ')(E:ESR $ 23.71 185LB $ 4,386.35 NO BID BLANK NO BID 185LB NO BID 1LB BAYER $ 26.70 185LB $ 4,939.50 LB BAYER $ 33.20 185LB $ 6,142.00
6 HARDBALL 2.5 GAL CONTAINER GAL ggEOI%ESI\jQ $ 31.84| 1275GAL |$ 40,596.00 NO BID BLANK NO BID 1275 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1275 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1275 GAL NO BID
7 HARDBALL 250 GAL CONTAINER GAL HSEQIBI;'\ISA $ 31.64 | 1500GAL |$ 47,460.00 NO BID BLANK NO BID 1500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1500 GAL NO BID
8 SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL CONTAINER GAL 5%?5_%2‘3 $ 1142 | 200GAL |$ 2,284.00 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 39.97( 200GAL |$ 3,197.60 GAL RRSI/NIS $ 7.84( 200 GAL $ 1,568.00] GAL DREXEL $ 10.10 200GAL |$ 2,020.00
9 GROUNDED 2.5 GAL GAL o'iil)_?EO':g $ 2160 70 GAL |$ 1,512.00| NOBID BLANK NO BID 70 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 70 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 70 GAL NO BID
10 LB BAYER $ 92.32| 100LB. |$ 9,232.00 | NOBID BLANK NO BID 100 LB. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 LB. NO BID LB BAYER $ 87.04( 100LB. |$ 8,704.00
PERSPECTIVE 5 LB CONTAINER 352-846
11 GAL MONSANTO $ 1820 | 200GAL |$ 3,640.00 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 239.79| 200GAL |$ 19,183.20 GAL ROUNDUP $ 15.83| 200GAL ($ 3,166.00 GAL DOW $ 18.90) 200GAL |$ 3,780.00
RODEO 2.5 GAL CONTAINER 62719-324 CUSTOM
12 GROUND ZERO 1 PINT CONTAINER PINT OHSEES‘S $ 9.25| 460 PINTS |$ 4,255.00 | NOBID BLANK NOBID | 460 PINTS NO BID PINT RRSI/14286 | $ 9.80| 460 PINTS |$ 4,508.00 QUART ALLIGARE [$  13.20 230 QUARTS| $ 3,036.00
FOAM BUSTER CHEM
13 1 PINT CONTAINER PINT HELENA |$ 8.40 | 48PINTS |$ 40320 | QUART BLANK |$ 19.79| 48PINTS | $ 47496 NOBID NO BID NO BID 48 PINTS NO BID QUART ALLIGARE |$ 9.30 | 24 QUARTS | $ 223.20
092210
MSMA, MSMA
14 30 GAL CONTAINER GAL 42519-3 $ 24.76 600 GAL |$ 14,856.00 NO BID BLANK NO BID 600 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 600 GAL NO BID GAL DREXEL $ 24.20 600 GAL |$ 14,520.00
15 MSMA 250 GAL GAL z'l\gglMgz $ 25.55| 1500 GAL |$ 38,325.00 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 96.89| 1500 GAL | $ 58,134.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1500 GAL NO BID GAL DREXEL $ 23.60| 1500 GAL ($ 35,400.00
HELENA RRSTIVM
16 GAL 031011 $ 37.94 24 GAL $ 910.56 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 87.99| 25GAL $ 879.90 GAL MARKING | $ 18.73 24GAL [$ 449.52 GAL MILLIKEN [$ 44.00 25 GAL $ 1,100.00
SPRAY INDICATOR DYE DYE
17 TRYCERA 2.5 GAL GAL 59|(-)|sc-§80 $ 87.40| 250GAL |$ 21,850.00 | NOBID BLANK NO BID 250 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID| 250 GAL NO BID GAL DOW $ 4480 250GAL |$ 11,200.00
18 0z BAYER $ 16.60 60 LB $ 996.00| NOBID BLANK NO BID 60 LB NO BID 0z BAYER $ 1263 9600Z |$ 12,124.80 0z BAYER $ 1340 60 LB $ 12,864.00
TELAR 16 OZ CONTAINER 352-654 ’ ) ’ ) ’ T ’ ) T
19 oz VALENT $ 15.27 40 LB. $ 610.80 200z BLANK $ 349.98 640 OZ $ 11,199.36 oz VALENT $ 16.14 640 OZ $ 10,329.60 oz VALENT $ 13.79 40 LB. $ 8,825.60
OUTRIDER 20 OZ CONTAINER 531-500
NUFARM NUFARM
20 WEEDSTROY, 2, 4-D AMINE, 2.5 GAL GAL 298-145 $ 11.82 2451LB $ 2,895.90 2.5 GAL BLANK $ 59.98| 245GAL [$ 5,878.04 GAL 19003 $ 1200 245GAL |$ 2,940.00 GAL ALLIGARE |$ 1120 | 245GAL |$ 2,744.00
CONTAINER
21 GAL pow $ 40.00 70 GAL $ 2,800.00 NO BID BLANK NO BID 70 GAL NO BID GAL DOW $ 40.00 70GAL [$ 2,800.00 GAL DOW $ 40.00 70 GAL $ 2,800.00
CAPSTONE 2.5 GAL CONTAINER 62719-527
NUFARM NUFARM
22 POLARIS GAL 226-534 $ 46.40| 10GAL |$ 464.00| NOBID BLANK NO BID 10 GAL NO BID GAL 19032 $ 58.00| 10GAL [$ 580.00 GAL ALLIGARE |$  64.90 10GAL |$ 649.00
23 ESPLANADE GAL 422‘1553 $ 111360| 90GAL |$ 100,224.00 | NOBID BLANK NO BID 90 GAL NO BID GAL BAYER |$  1,11360| 90GAL |$ 100,224.00 GAL BAYER $ 1,113.60 90GAL |$ 100,224.00
NUFARM BASF
24 IMAZAPIC GAL 71368-99 $ 10410| 16 GAL |$ 1,665.60 | NOBID BLANK NO BID 16 GAL NO BID GAL 01014 $ 132.00| 16 GAL |$ 2,112.00 GAL ALLIGARE |$ 11200| 16 GAL |$ 1,792.00
25 E'SI,:ISTTAAIE:RPSROFESSIONAL 1GAL GAL FMC 3206 219 $ 36.10 12 GAL $ 433.20 1GAL BLANK $ 59.97 12 GAL $ 719.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID 12 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12 GAL NO BID
26 OUST XTRA LB BsAsg{gsR $ 2385| 100LB. |$ 2,385.00 | NOBID BLANK NO BID 100 LB. NO BID 1LB BAYER |[$ 27.00| 100LB. |$ 2,700.00 LB BAYER $ 3320 100LB. |$ 3,320.00
ITEM TOTAL $ 2,187.7100 $410,214.2100 | $ 1,633.3800 $ 24154650 | $ 1,833.1800 $  250,571.67 2,059.3800 $  326,243.30
Red Font  |Prices in Red indicate substitution items and/or quantity deviations. See bid submissions for detd
Purchasing Calculations
Delivery is guranteed not later than days
after order date 4 5 7 5-7 days
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HELENA CHEMICAL

HUMPHRIES TURF SUPPLY

RED RIVER SPECIALITIES, LLC.

VM DISTRIBUTION PARTNERS

1tem No Description Unitof | Mfg./Product | Price Each | Estimated | Extended Price | Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Each| Estimated Extended Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Each | Estimated | Extended Price Unitof |Mfg./Product| Price Estimated | Extended Price
) Measure No. Quantity Measure No. Quantity Price Measure No. Quantity Measure No. Each Quantity

Minimum Order Per Delivery $ $2,000.00 0 N/A 0

Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES YES NO
Equal Opportunity Certification Form YES YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES YES
Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13 YES YES YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES YES YES
PACA Page YES YES YES YES
Signature Page YES YES YES YES
Current Label and Material Safety Sheet YES NO YES YES

Contact Information

Helena Chemical

PO Box 626, Selma, AL 36702 | Greg Wall P:334.875.2737 E: wellg@helenachemical.com

Humphries Turf Supply

PO Box 39, Joppa, AL 35087 | Misty Martin P: 256.586.8760 E: humphriesturf@otelco.net

Red River Specialities, LLC

1324 N Hearne Avenue., Suite 120, Shreveport, LA 71107 | Chad Chambliss P: 318.425.5944 E: bid.clerk@rrsi.com

VM Distribution Partners

805 Decatur Street, Newton, MS 39345 | Sloan Everitt P: 601.683.6466 E: mvega3@progressivesolutions.net
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